Raynelle

From: susan moe <kidomol@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 11, 2018 3:34 PM
To: Mo Hansen

Subject: Snow shoveling

Attachments: 20180108_133235,jpg

Attached is a photo of what was shoveled. A section of sidewalk that leads to the dead end of Derby Street. No
one ever walks to the dead end of the street. We had our main sidewalk on Lexington Way and the approach
shoveled just not the section of Derby. The 1st year we lived here we shoveled the sidewalk even tho the
street was never plowed. When they started plowing the street, someone in a city truck made mention that it
was not a big deal if the side wasn't shoveled since its a dead end. So for 3 years we haven't shoveled and this
year we had an inch of snows and get ticketed.

Thanks,

Sue

Get Qutlook for Android







Dear to whom it may concern,

I heard from my neighbor about the city council decision on the December 12, 2017 snow removal
fines from the January 4™ 2018 meeting, that were paid might be reimbursed. And also needed to send
or drop a letter such as this. Yes | would like my $95.00 back if that is the decision to reimburse. Also
included a copy of the original bill.

Thanks for your time, REC:ZIVED §
William Bagneski JAN 1722018 |

i
316 S. Washington St. ﬂgr{“, '?Bifi‘z ?

Waterloo, WI 53594



INVOICE

DATE: December 14, 2017

INVOICE #: 0104-17

DUE DATE: December 29, 2017

CUST #: 400
Biil To: Bill From: City of Waterloo
William Bagneski 136 N. Monroe Street

- Waterloo, Wi 53594

316 S Washington Street Phone [920-478-3025]

SR A W WA N
Waterloo, W! 53594 [%0) ] 1
o 2
Q57 “33 Y
PANCELT Y4
DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT

2017 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel #290-0813-0822-061, 1
316 S. Washington Street, Waterloo
12/12/2017 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00 9
PER HOUR MINIMUM
2 EMPLOYEES FOR 2 MINUTES EACH 3 $ 95.00

TOTAL |3 95.00

Please include the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo

(Payment is due 15 Days from the Invoice Date)



STATEMENT

CITY OF WATERLOO
136 NORTH MONROE STREET
WATERLOO, WISCONSIN 53594-1198

TAX PARCEL # 230 0813~ 0822 -00)

OWNERS NAME William Bagresk:

appress 314 S I/Uzﬂs(")/gwﬂd/\ 5

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW &ICE CONTROL

paTE: /27217
startive: 2: /€ £ m

FINISH TIME: £ ;24 £ M COMMENTS.

PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED THE SIDEWALK
OF SNOW AND OR ICE FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.
g ~ 0
MIMIUM CHARGE: $99. .
DPW LABOR: 1. 3. 4. 5. MEN.

EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW PLOW AND/OR SANDERW/OPERATOR = $85.00HR MIMIUM

TRACTOR/SNOW BLOWER/BLADEW/OPERATOR = $75.00HR MIMIUM

SNOW SHOVELING AND/ORSALTING = $95.00HR MIMIUM)C'.

THE SNOWFALL STARTED ON ’Z/H_/ 17 AT 3 4§ b wm

THE SNOWFALL ENDED ON [[J/ J7aT 1.00 /L M.

SIGNATURE OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL
g 1887

, 77
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January 10, 2018

City of Waterloo

C/0 Mo Hansen City Clerk
136 North Monroe Street
Waterloo, WI 53594

RE Invoice # 0156-18
| respectfully request an appeal of invoice 0156-18 with the Administration Review Committee.

il T Uy

William T Hogan
601 Mohawk Ct
Waterloo, WI 53594



INVOICE

DATE: January 4, 2018
INVOICE #: 04156-18-c0c3 ~13
DUE DATE: January 19, 2018
CUST #: 410
Bill To: Bill From: City of Waterloo
Hogan, William 136 N. Monroe Street
- Waterloo, Wi 53594
601 Mohawk Court Phone [920-478-3025]
Waterloo, Wl 53594
DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT
2018 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel #290-0813-0643-026, 1 $ )
601 Mohawk Court, Waterioo
01/02/2018 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00 2 $ )
PER HOUR MINIMUM
2 EMPLOYEES FOR 1 MINUTE EACH 3 3 95.00
TOTAL |$ -95.00

Please include the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo

(Payment is due 15 Days from the Invoice Date)



STATEMENT
CITY OF WATERLOO

136 N. MONROE STREET
WATERLOO, WI 53594-1198

TAX PARCEL # 290-0813-0(43-026

owNERS NAME __ William \Aoo)o«v\

ADDRESS M/ /’fﬂ}w W/C éjf :

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW & ICE CONTROL

DATE: [ - L - /59
starrivE: [ 6 00 M.

FINISH TIME: J N @ M.

COMMENTS:
PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED

THE SIDEWALK OF SNOW AND/OR ICE

FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

MINIMUM CHARGE: 37527

DPW LABOR: 1.(%. 3. 4. 5. MEN.

EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW PLOW AND/OR SANDER W/OPERATOR = $85.00/HR MINIMUM ___
TRACTOR/SNOW BLOWER/BLADE W/OPERATOR = $75.00/HR MINIMUM ___

SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING = $95.00/HR MINIMUM ’v

1HE sNowFALL STARTED ON J2 [T ar | 00 f u
THE SNOWFALL ENDED ON /3 124/ /7 at Jp . 10 P M.

SIGNATURE OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL

S
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