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DATE:
INVO|CE #:
DUE DATE:

GUST #:

Bill From:

INVOICE
December 14,2017

0120-17

December 29,2017
416

City of Waterloo
136 N. Monroe Street

Waterloo, Wl 53594

Phone 1920-478-30251

BillTo:

Chad Melotte

760 Lexington Way
Waterloo, Wl 53594

2017 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel#290-0813-0521-017,
Lexington Way, Waterloo

1211212017 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00
PER HOUR MINIMUM

2 EMPLOYEES FOR 3 MINUTES EACH

Please include the invoice number and make ail checks payabte to:

City of Waterloo
(Payment ís due 15 Days from the lnvoice Date)
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STATEMENT

CITY OF WATERLOO
I36 NORTH MONROE STREET

WATERLOO, WISCONSIN 53594-1 I 98

Lqa - agß- D52,t-ottTAX PARCEL #

OWNERS NAME ChaL f\^r¿\o tte-

ADDRESS'@Þo/

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW &ICE CONTROL

"or"'fl- 12:17

srARr IIME: L,òf Ê . t
FINISH rIME: L'tL Q .*

PI.IBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED THE SIDEWALK
OF SNOW AND OR ICE FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

MIMIUM CHARGE: S!{i
DPWLABoR: t.Q t. +. 5. MEN.

EQUIPMENTUSED:

TRUCK-SNO'W PLOW AND/OR SANDERWOPERATOR : $85.OOHR MIMIUM

TRACTOR/SNOWBLOWER/BLADEW/OPERATOR =$75.00HRMIMIUM

: snr.oo"* t,tru*x.

COMMENTS.

SNOW SHOVELING AND/ORSALTING

rHE sNowFALL srARrrn oNfofuJ7 n
rHE sNowFALL ENDED oN lll^lJ

OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL
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DATE:
INVOICE #:
DUE DATE:

CUST #:

INVOICE
January 4,2018

01 60-1 I
January 19,2018

452

BillTo:

Orchard Storage LLC

717 Lum Avenue

Waterloo, Wl 53594

Bill From: City of Waterloo
136 N. Monroe Street

Waterloo, Wl 53594

Phone [920-478-3025]

W
,:</"\ ff

ffi.ffi

DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT

2018 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel#290-0813-0521-015,
660 Lexington Way, Waterloo

1 $

01IO2I2O18 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00
PER HOUR MINIMUM

2 $

2 EMPLOYEES FOR 2 MINUTES EACH 3 $ 95.00

TOTAL $ 9500

Please include the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo
(Payment ís due 15 Days from the Invoice Date)



't o'-

STATEMENT

CITY OF WATERLOO
136 N. MONROE STREET

WATERLOO, WI 53594-1198

TAXPARcEL# Na-oîtz'o5al-o rl

owNERS NAME OccÀa.Á SbrqSe L¿c,

ADDRESS t tl Le x f qú lr n uz¿ '

'ltf tt*,nfue-

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW & ICE CONTROL

DArE: l-7'l(
START TIME: P- . SA P *.
FrMSH rIME: Í- , øt P . *.

COMMENTS:

PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED
THE SIDEWALK OF SNOW AND/OR ICE
FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

MINIMUM CHARGE: fiqS '""
A,

DPW LABOR: r. (/. 3. 4. 5. MEN.

EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW pLOW AND/OR SANDER WOPERA.T6R = 985.00/HR MINIMUM _

TRÁ,CTOR/SNOW BLOWER/BI,ADE W/OPERATOR = $75.00/HR MINIMUM 

-SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING = $95.OOIHR MINIMUM21

rHE sNowFALL srARrED oN JL)h-Ü-n I ,âô -t-*
THESNowFALLENDED o* IL,&]2* þ 'Y) P *.

SIGNATURE OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL
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Mo Hansen

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Phone Notes- Kenneth Frandle.

Mo Hansen <cítyhall@waterloowi.us>

Tuesday, January 09, 20L8 1:l-9 PM

Waterloo Clerk/Treas Office
920 Lum Ave / Frandle Review Request

Kenneth Frandle called shortly after noon today (U9/2OI8) asking if his DPW invoice for snow shoveling of a sidewalk

was related to his recent request for assistance in clearing his driveway. I said the two were not connected. Mr. Frandle

asked that his invoice be reviewed. He said:
- He is 100 disabled.
- His sister Vicki travels to Waterloo to clear the walk and did clear the driveway later that day, after DPW has already

removed snow.
- Vicki assumed the neighbors had cleared the walk when she arrived that evening to clear snow.
- Never previous in his 25 years in the City had he received such an invoice.
- He is able to pay 55 per month, but asked that the invoice be reviewed and voided.
- Unable to promptly communicate in writing, he asked that hisverbal request be accepted so the matter could be

posted to the 1/10 Administrative Review Appeals Board meeting.

NOTES:

Kenneth Frandle called this office in mid-December stating that he was 100% disabled. He asked if assistance in clearing

snow was available. I said the municipality did not have a program of that type. I said I would follow-up with the School

District to see if a willing student could be put in contact with Mr. Frandle to assist in snow/ice removal. After talking by

phone today with Mr. Frandle I reached Carman Follmer, a guidance counselor at the School. She recorded Frandle's

contactinformationandsaidshewouldcheckwith BradDonnerandseeifastudentwouldbe¡nterestedinhelpingMr.
Frandle.

Mo Hansen
Clerk/Treasurer
City of Waterloo
otfice: 920.478.3025
CitvHall @Waterloowi. us

I MUNTCTPAL WEBPAGE I |NFO ALERTS SIGN-UP I

ï¡Ei
136 North Monroe Street . Waterloo, Wl 53594-1 198. Fax: 920.478.2021



Mo Hansen

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Carmen Foll mer < Fol I merC@waterloo.kl2.wi.us>
Tuesday, January 09, 20L8 1-:l-6 PM

City Hall

follow up

HiMo,
I just got off of the phone with Ken Frandle. I suggested to him that he create a flyer to put up at Piggly Wiggly (or

anywhere else that has a board). If I hear of any students lookinE for worh I will direct them to the board.

Ken thought that would work.

Thanks for reaching out!
Carmen

This message may contain confidential i¡formatio¡ and Ís iûtended only for the individual(s) named, If you are not a named addressee,

you should not disseminateo distribute, or eopy this e-mail Please notiff the sender immediarely if you have received this e-mail by
mistake and delets it from yûur systen.



DATE:
INVO|CE #:

DUE DATE:
CUST #:

Bill From:

INVOICE
January 4,2018

A140-18 .7
January,n,rrO:Z

City of Waterloo
136 N. Monroe Street

Waterloo, Wl 53594

Phone [920478-3025]

Bill To:

Frandle, Kenneth

920 Lum Avenue

Waterloo, Wl 53594

DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT

2017 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel #290-0813-0522-047,
920 Lum Avenue, Waterloo 1 $

1212712017 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00
PER HOUR MINIMUM

2 $

2 EMPLOYEES FOR 5 MINUTES EACH 3 $ 95.00

TOTAL $ 95.00

Please lnclude the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo
(Payment is due 15 Days from the lnvoÍce Date)



h4

STATEMENT

CITY OF WATERLOO
136 NORTH MONROE STREET

WATERLOO, WISCONSIN 53594-I I98

â,90 " ¡g¡3 -ôsll.0q1
(¿nn.trh Fr¿,"nd le

ADDRESS 9A 4^an ,4"e

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

TAX PARCEL #

O\A/NERS NAME

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW &ICE CONTROL

oorrJ-I.2-? -17
srARr rIME: L, ¡L t . *
FINISH rIME: L, 2?-fl.t

PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED THE SIDEWALK
OF SNOW AND OR ICE FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

MIMIUM GHARGE: UgS'?t
DPWLABOR: t.þ Z. +. 5. MEN.

EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW PLOW AND/OR SANDERWOPERATOR: $85.OOHR MIMIUM

TRACTOR/SNOWBLOV/ER/BLADEW/OPERATOR :$T5.OOHRMIMIUM

SNOW SHOVELING AND/ORSALTING : s95 ooHR ¡utt¡ulu¡ø.{ .

rHE sNowFALL srARreo oN{12¡14 o, ( 'oo ,{ ¡v.

rHE sNov/FALL ENDED oN/ì./JVl?

COMMENTS.

¡¡1 'êo P M



¡

*t)[.- 
.- *-

ri,
n'-.: ì4F

-

ialT
F

ffiil
:*-C

lr"l_- 
.

ur' 
\.r',¡ 

¡

r-.--:" 
'li

i 
\,1

ï:Å
ñ$ 

,.
:,, 

d. 
,

.., 
--4,-.at

't 
'Ð

'/
:

'tr._ tÌ..

,'t

:'.iç't-w
.'''

Ð
ffi#$



!æ
-i 

-.
ãT

-J
t. 

' 
,'.

,, 
* 

;F
.'+

".
' :

- 
ä{

is
t*

 -'*
&

l-{
S

r,
&

d¿
-É

lfi
.:|

H
i

i''
 

n:
."

rc
ô4

8-
-;

..-
+

 
#j

,-
[*

'


