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INVQ

DATE: December 14, 2017
INVOICE #: 0120-17
DUE DATE: December 29, 2017
CUST #: 416
Bill To: Bill From: City of Waterloo
Chad Melotte 136 N. Monroe Street
- Waterloo, Wil 53594
760 Lexington Way Phone [920-478-3025]
Waterloo, W! 53594
'DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT
2017 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel #290-0813-0521-017, 1
760 Lexington Way, Waterloo
12/12/2017 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00 5
PER HOUR MINIMUM
2 EMPLOYEES FOR 3 MINUTES EACH 3 $ 95.00
TOTAL | $ 95.00

Please include the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo

(Payment is due 15 Days from the Invoice Date)



STATEMENT
CITY OF WATERLOO

136 NORTH MONROE STREET
WATERLOO, WISCONSIN 53594-1198

TAX PARCEL # 290~ 0813~ 052101

owNERS NAME ([ had. W\@/\ot‘ra
appress 160 Lex (n uion L,/Ay
7

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW &ICE CONTROL
pate:[L- /2-]7
START TIME: | :0f _p ‘M
FINISH TIME: | : /) L@_ M COMMENTS.

PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED THE SIDEWALK
OF SNOW AND OR ICE FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

G 29
MIMIUM CHARGE: § 4¢. 7"

DPW LABOR: 1.7 3. 4. 5. MEN.
EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW PLOW AND/OR SANDERW/OPERATOR = $85.00HR MIMIUM

TRACTOR/SNOW BLOWER/BLADEW/OPERATOR = $75.00HR MIMIUM

P
SNOW SHOVELING AND/ORSALTING = $95.00HR MIMIUM%.

THE SNOWFALL STARTED ON/2/ J//J7AT 346 An
THE SNOWFALL ENDED ON /2//// L;]AT V.60 , Ag M.

SIGNATURE OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL
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Bill To:
Orchard Storage LLC

717 Lum Avenue
Waterloo, WI 53594

DATE:
INVOICE #:
DUE DATE:
CUST #:

Bill From:

January 4, 2018
0160-18

January 19, 2018
452

City of Waterloo
136 N. Monroe Street
Waterloo, WI 53594
Phone [920-478-3025]

DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT
2018 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parcel #290-0813-0521-015, y 3
660 Lexington Way, Waterloo
01/02/2018 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00 5 $ )
PER HOUR MINIMUM
2 EMPLOYEES FOR 2 MINUTES EACH 3 $ 95.00
TOTAL |$ 95.00

Please include the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo

(Payment is due 15 Days from the Invoice Date)




STATEMENT
CITY OF WATERLOO

136 N. MONROE STREET
WATERLOO, Wi 53594-1198

TAX PARCEL# 290-08(% 0521018

OWNERS NAME Orchacd Siﬁ‘@f‘&ﬁ\@ L N Lum Ave

)

ADDRESS 444 Lé’x/‘nj}zf‘n wef

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW & ICE CONTROL

pate: [ -2~ K
starT TIME: [2 : 59 P u

FINISH TIME: | . &l £ w

COMMENTS:
PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED

THE SIDEWALK OF SNOW AND/OR ICE

FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

MINIMUM CHARGE: $ g8.2°

DPW LABOR: 1.{# 3. 4. 5. MEN,

EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW PLOW AND/OR SANDER W/OPERATOR = $85.00/HR MINIMUM ___
TRACTOR/SNOW BLOWER/BLADE W/OPERATOR = $75.00/HR MINIMUM ___

SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING = $95.00/HR MINIMUM)<

THE SNOWFALL STARTED ON [2 / Qﬂ/ /7 AT / 00 /) M.

THE SNOWFALL ENDED ON /2 / 29/ /7 AT ﬁ : 30 @ M.

SIGNATURE OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL
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Mo Hansen

From: Mo Hansen <cityhall@waterloowi.us>
Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2018 1:19 PM
To: Waterloo Clerk/Treas Office

Subject: 920 Lum Ave / Frandle Review Request

Phone Notes- Kenneth Frandle.

Kenneth Frandle called shortly after noon today (1/9/2018) asking if his DPW invoice for snow shoveling of a sidewalk
was related to his recent request for assistance in clearing his driveway. | said the two were not connected. Mr. Frandle
asked that his invoice be reviewed. He said:

- He is 100 disabled.

- His sister Vicki travels to Waterloo to clear the walk and did clear the driveway later that day, after DPW has already
removed snow.

- Vicki assumed the neighbors had cleared the walk when she arrived that evening to clear snow.

- Never previous in his 25 years in the City had he received such an invoice.

- He is able to pay $5 per month, but asked that the invoice be reviewed and voided.

- Unable to promptly communicate in writing, he asked that his verbal request be accepted so the matter could be
posted to the 1/10 Administrative Review Appeals Board meeting.

NOTES:

Kenneth Frandle called this office in mid-December stating that he was 100% disabled. He asked if assistance in clearing
snow was available. | said the municipality did not have a program of that type. |said | would follow-up with the School
District to see if a willing student could be put in contact with Mr. Frandle to assist in snow/ice removal. After talking by
phone today with Mr. Frandle | reached Carman Follmer, a guidance counselor at the School. She recorded Frandle’s
contact information and said she would check with Brad Donner and see if a student would be interested in helping Mr.
Frandle.

Mo Hansen
Clerk/Treasurer

City of Waterloo

office: 920.478.3025
CityHall@Waterloowi.us

| MUNICIPAL WEBPAGE | INFO ALERTS SIGN-UP |

136 North Monroe Street « Waterloo, Wl 53594-1198 « Fax: 920.478.2021



Mo Hansen

From: Carmen Follmer <FollmerC@waterloo.k12.wi.us>
Sent: Tuesday, January 09, 2018 1:16 PM

To: City Hall

Subject: follow up

Hi Mo,

I just got off of the phone with Ken Frandle. I suggested to him that he create a flyer to put up at Piggly Wiggly (or
anywhere else that has a board). If I hear of any students looking for work, I will direct them to the board.

Ken thought that would work.
Thanks for reaching out!

Carmen

This message may contain confidential information and is intended only for the individual(s) named. If you are not a named addressee,
you should not disseminate, distribute, or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately if you have received this e-mail by
mistake and delete it from your system.



INVOICE

DATE: January 4, 2018
INVOICE #: 0140-18 11
DUE DATE: January 19, 2018
CUST #: 434
Bill To: Bill From: City of Waterloo
Frandle, Kenneth 136 N. Monroe Street
Waterloo, Wl 53594
920 Lum Avenue Phone [920-478-3025]
Waterloo, W1 53594
DESCRIPTION ITEM # AMOUNT
2017 SNOW & ICE CONTROL - Parce| #290-0813-0522-047, 1 $
920 Lum Avenue, Waterloo )
12/27/2017 SNOW SHOVELING AND/OR SALTING AT $95.00 5 $ N
PER HOUR MINIMUM
2 EMPLOYEES FOR 5 MINUTES EACH 3 $ 95.00
TOTAL |$ 95.00

Please include the invoice number and make all checks payable to:

City of Waterloo

(Payment is due 15 Days from the Invoice Date)



{4

STATEMENT
CITY OF WATERLOO

136 NORTH MONROE STREET
WATERLOO, WISCONSIN 53594-1198

TAX PARCEL # A90-0813 05 -047)

OWNERS NAME )(e nneth Frand le

ADDRESS 572& {«Am /4-1/6

PLEASE MAKE ALL PAYMENTS TO WATERLOO CITY TREASURER

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

SNOW &ICE CONTROL

DATE; ”\‘ ) 7 -/ 7
STARTTIME: | :// _f_ M
FINISH TIME: | : 22 _@.M COMMENTS.

PUBLIC WORKS EMPLOYEES CLEARED THE SIDEWALK
OF SNOW AND OR ICE FROM THE ABOVE PROPERTY.

0
MIMIUM CHARGE: § 932

DPW LABOR: 1.4 3. 4. 5. MEN.
EQUIPMENT USED:

TRUCK-SNOW PLOW AND/OR SANDERW/OPERATOR = $85.00HR MIMIUM

TRACTOR/SNOW BLOWER/BLADEW/OPERATOR = $75.00HR MIMIUM

SNOW SHOVELING AND/ORSALTING =$95.00HR MIMIUM)C :

THE SNOWFALL STARTED ON/A /Y f]aT € .00 A wm
THE SNOWFALL ENDED ON/2 29 [)ar L :0¢ P um

SIGNATURE OF PUBLIC WORKS OFFICIAL
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